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--Last Year’s Bid-- 
Kohl Wholesale 
Escalating/De-
escalating Bid 

   
DAIRY   

1% white milk ½ pint .2384 
50 ct. 

Skim Chocolate Milk ½ pint .2570 
50 ct. 

Unflavored skim milk ½ pint .2344 
50 ct. 

Low fat buttermilk ½ gallon .9950 
16/32 oz. 

No fat cottage cheese 5# 2.8433 
12/24 oz. 

No fat sour cream 5# 1.4833 
18/16 oz. 

Individual sour cream 100 count 10.69 
Yogurt – Variety 4 oz See List 
Yogurt – Variety 6 oz. See List 

Half & Half Quart 2.2975 
16 ct. 

Whipping Cream Quart 4.4063 
16 ct. 

   
Crave-a-Latte, Skim Pint No Bid 

Strawberry milk, skim ½ pint .2570 
50 ct. 

Vanilla milk, skim ½ pint No Bid 

Unflavored milk, skim Pint .9042 
12 ct. 

Chocolate milk, skim Pint .9208 
1%, 12 ct. 

Strawberry milk, skim Pint .8817 
1%, 12 ct. 

Tea Pint .5350 
12 ct. 

Lemonade Pint .7100 
12 ct. 

Lemonade Drink Gallon 1.4875 
4 ct. 

Punch Drink Gallon 1.4875 
4 ct. 

   
Cheese American 
Slice 160 cut 40.77 Mkt 

4/5# 

Shredded Cheddar 5 pounds 10.71 Mkt 
4 ct. 

DRAFT
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Give the price per unit as specified. 
 

Submit Both a Firm Bid and an Escalating/De-Escalating Bid 
 

     
 
*RECOMMEND for 2014-2015 
 

 
 
 

 Jackson 
Produce Co. 

Kohl 
Wholesale 

Hiland Dairy 
(Drop Svc) 

*Hiland 
Dairy 

(Full Svc) 
  NO BID NO BID    
DAIRY      

1/2Pints      
1% Unflavored Milk ½ pint   .2645 .2945 
Skim Unflavored Milk ½ pint   .2600 .2900 
Skim Chocolate Milk ½ pint   .2798 .3098 
Skim Strawberry Milk ½ pint   .2798 .3098 

12 Oz. Bottles      
Low-Fat Unflavored Milk 12 oz.   .7711 .8111 
Skim Chocolate Milk 12 oz.   .7607 .8007 
Skim Strawberry Milk 12 oz.   .7607 .8007 
Orange Juice 100%  12 oz.   .69 .71 

Red Diamond      
Tea-Unsweetened Pint   .86 .88 
Tea-Splenda Pint   .86 .88 
   Tea – All 12 oz.   .71 .73 
Drinking Water, 16 oz. Case   4.77 4.99 
      
Slice American Cheese, 160 Loaf   Board Board 
Shredded Cheddar Cheese 5 lbs.   Board Board 
Low-Fat Cottage Cheese 5 lbs.   9.35 9.85 
Low-Fat Cottage Cheese, Ind. 4 oz.   .54 .55 
Low-Fat Sour Cream 5 lbs.   8.30 8.80 
      
Greek Yogurt, All Flavors 5.3 oz.   .83 .84 
Yogurt, All Flavors 6 oz.   .55 .56 
Yogurt, All Flavors 4 oz.   .55 .56 DRAFT
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BREAD  PRODUCTS  
--Last Year’s Bid-- 
Flowers Baking Co. 

Springfield/ 
Batesville AR 

   
Whole Grain White Bread, 20 slice 1½ lb. 1.53 
Whole Grain Wheat Bread, 20 slice 1½ lb. 1.40 
Whole Grain French Bread, sliced 1 lb. 1.37 
Whole Grain Texas Toast, 16 slice 1½ lb. 1.40 
Whole Grain Hamburger Buns, 4” Packed 12/1 4.62 
Whole Grain Hot Dog Buns, 6” Packed 16/1 2.62 
Whole Grain Deli Buns, Hoagie, 6” Packed 8/1 1.30 

 

WHOLE GRAIN BREAD  PRODUCTS  
*Earth Grains 

(Bimbo Bakeries) 
Springfield 

Flowers Baking Co. 
Springfield/ 

Batesville AR 
   NO BID 
Whole Grain White Wheat Bread, 20 slice 1½ lb. 1.52  
Whole Grain Wheat Bread, 20 slice 20 oz. 1.40  
Whole Grain Texas Toast, 16 slice, White 1½  lb. 1.40  
    
Whole Grain Hamburger Buns, 4” Packed 12/1 1.80  
Whole Grain Hot Dog Buns, 6” Packed 16/1 2.45  
Whole Grain Deli Buns, Hoagie, 6” Packed 6/1 1.30  
    
Regular White Hot Dog Bun Packed 16/1 2.30  
Regular White Hamburger Bun Packed 12/1 1.80  

 
*RECOMMEND for 2014-2015 
 

Submit  Firm  Bid  Only 
 DRAFT
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